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Miriam Merad M.D., Ph.D. is the   
Director of the Precision Immunology 
Institute at Mount Sinai School  
of Medicine in New York and of  
the Mount Sinai Human Immune 
Monitoring Center (HIMC). 

Miriam Merad’s research focuses 
on immune cells, particularly 
dendritic cells and resident mac-
rophages, and their roles in 
pathogenesis of cancer progres-
sion and inflammatory disease 
with hope to develop possible 
therapeutic. 

June 16, 2022
4:00 – 6:00 pm

Online event
Link after registration

A networking event 
for women scientists
Early- and intermediate-career 
women scientists are offered the 
opportunity to network with a 
distinguished researcher or a person 
active in the field of technology 
transfer. During this open, informal 
seminar, we will discuss topics such 
as career planning, reconciliation  
of work and family life, but also 
moments of success and challenges 
of the career path with our guest.  

Miriam Merad will be our guest and 
will share insights from her career 
journey.

Please register until June 13, 2022
Equal.opportunity@bihealth.de

With more than 200 primary papers 
and thousands of citations, Dr 
Merad’s work has been acknowl-
edged by National Institute of 
Health and American Society of 
Clinical Investigation. She has 
received the William B. Coley Award 
for Distinguished Research in Basic 
and Tumour Immunology. She is 
the President-elect of the Inter-
national Union of Immunological 
Societies and was elected to the 
National Academy of Sciences in 
recognition of her contributions to 
the field of immunology. 
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